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Robert E. Howard, the renowned creator of Conan the Barbarian, also left
an indelible mark on the horror genre with his haunting tales of cosmic
horror and supernatural dread. His stories, often set in the Cthulhu Mythos
created by H.P. Lovecraft, delve into the depths of human fear and
madness, exploring the darker recesses of our psyche.

Cosmic Horror And The Cthulhu Mythos

Howard's horror stories are deeply rooted in the Cthulhu Mythos, a shared
fictional universe populated by ancient, cosmic entities of immense power
and malevolence. These beings, known as the Great Old Ones, lie dormant
beneath the earth and in the depths of the sea, awaiting the day when they
will awaken and reclaim their dominion over the world.

In Howard's stories, the influence of the Cthulhu Mythos is evident in the
recurring themes of cosmic insignificance and the futility of human
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resistance. His characters are often confronted with horrors that defy
comprehension, driving them to madness or despair.

Unforgettable Characters And Haunting Settings

Howard's horror stories feature a cast of unforgettable characters, each
grappling with their own unique demons. From the tormented artist Francis
Wayland Thurston in "The Thing On The Roof" to the doomed sailor
Johansen in "The Call Of Cthulhu," these characters embody the
vulnerability and fragility of humanity in the face of the unknown.

Howard's settings are equally evocative, creating a palpable sense of
dread and isolation. Whether it's the crumbling castle of "The Black Stone"
or the desolate wasteland of "The Valley Of The Worm," his locations are
imbued with an eerie atmosphere that amplifies the horror.

Themes Of Fear And Madness

Throughout his horror stories, Howard explores the profound psychological
effects of fear and madness. His characters are often pushed to the brink of
sanity, their minds unraveling under the weight of the horrors they have
witnessed.

In "The Shadow Kingdom," the protagonist, Bran Mak Morn, succumbs to
the allure of a cursed amulet, leading him down a path of madness and
destruction. In "The Children Of The Night," a group of explorers venture
into a subterranean realm, only to be confronted by a terrifying and ancient
evil that drives them to the brink.

Legacy Of Horror



Robert E. Howard's horror stories have left a lasting impact on the genre,
inspiring countless writers and filmmakers. His tales of cosmic horror and
supernatural dread continue to resonate with readers today, offering a
glimpse into the dark corners of the human psyche.

From the enduring popularity of Conan the Barbarian to the resurgence of
interest in the Cthulhu Mythos, Howard's legacy as a master of horror
fiction remains firmly entrenched. His stories continue to thrill and terrify
generations of readers, proving the timeless power of the macabre.

Robert E. Howard's horror stories are a testament to the enduring power of
the genre to explore the darkest depths of human fear and imagination. His
tales of cosmic horror, unforgettable characters, and haunting settings will
continue to captivate and horrify readers for generations to come.

So, if you dare to venture into the macabre world of Robert Howard, be
prepared for a spine-tingling journey into the unknown. His stories will leave
an indelible mark on your psyche, reminding you of the fragility of humanity
and the cosmic horrors that lurk just beyond the veil of reality.
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