
Curation in the Nationalist Age: A Historical
Analysis of South Asian Art in the Global
South
In the rapidly evolving landscape of the global art world, where national
identities and cultural heritage are increasingly intertwined, the role of
curation has become paramount. This article explores the complex and
multifaceted history of curation in South Asia in the context of nationalism,
highlighting its transformative impact on the exhibition and interpretation of
art.
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The Genesis of Curation in Colonial India

The origins of curation in South Asia can be traced back to the colonial era,
when Western powers established museums and collections to showcase
the region's rich cultural heritage. These early institutions, such as the
Indian Museum in Kolkata and the Victoria and Albert Museum in London,
were often driven by a desire to document and classify the "exotic" and
"primitive" art of the East. The curators of these institutions, predominantly
British, played a significant role in shaping the early narratives and
frameworks for understanding South Asian art.

The Rise of Nationalism and Cultural Revival

As nationalist sentiments grew in the 20th century, South Asian artists and
intellectuals began to question the Western-centric perspectives that had
dominated the art world. They sought to reclaim their cultural heritage and
establish independent artistic identities free from colonial influences. This
led to a resurgence of interest in traditional art forms, such as painting,
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sculpture, and textiles, and a desire to explore themes of national pride and
cultural identity.

Post-Independence Curation: The Assertion of National Narratives

After independence, South Asian nations established their own museums
and galleries, which became important platforms for the curation and
exhibition of national art. These institutions played a crucial role in
constructing and disseminating new narratives about the region's artistic
history, focusing on themes of cultural continuity, unity, and the struggle for
independence. Curators worked closely with artists to develop exhibitions
that celebrated national heroes, depicted historical events, and explored
the social and political issues facing post-colonial societies.

The Influence of Modernism and Globalization
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In the latter half of the 20th century, the influence of Western modernism
and globalization began to reshape the South Asian art world. Artists and
curators became increasingly engaged with international art movements
and trends, leading to a diversification of artistic styles and the emergence
of new forms of expression. This period witnessed the rise of contemporary
art, which challenged traditional notions of art and explored themes of
urbanization, consumerism, and the impact of technology.

Contemporary Curation: Negotiating Identity and Globalism

In recent decades, the role of curation in South Asia has become
increasingly complex and multifaceted. Contemporary curators face the
challenge of navigating the interplay between national identity,
globalization, and the diverse perspectives that shape the contemporary art
world. They grapple with questions of representation, inclusivity, and the
need to create exhibitions that resonate with both local and global
audiences.

Emerging Voices and Pluralistic Perspectives

One significant trend in contemporary curation in South Asia is the
emergence of new voices and perspectives. Curators from marginalized
communities, including women, LGBTQ+ individuals, and artists with
disabilities, are challenging mainstream narratives and offering alternative
interpretations of the region's artistic heritage. This has led to a more
inclusive and diverse representation of South Asian art, encompassing a
broader range of perspectives and experiences.

Challenges and Opportunities in the 21st Century



In the 21st century, curation in South Asia continues to evolve amidst a
rapidly changing global landscape. With the rise of digital technologies, the
accessibility and dissemination of art have expanded exponentially,
creating new opportunities for curators to engage with audiences around
the world. However, challenges remain, including the need to address
issues of cultural appropriation, the equitable distribution of resources, and
the promotion of sustainable practices in the art world.

Curation in the nationalist age of South Asia has played a pivotal role in
shaping the exhibition and interpretation of art. From its origins in the
colonial era to its contemporary iterations, curation has been at the
forefront of constructing narratives about national identity, cultural heritage,
and the complex interplay between local and global forces. As the art world
continues to evolve, curators in South Asia face the ongoing challenge of
negotiating tradition and modernity, inclusivity and diversity, and the ever-
changing global landscape.
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